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P1A Date Last First Position UPC Loc
Eff 
Date Rational Cl STEP FTE

Base
Salary STIP HR

Total 
Salary

P1A-8
HANDOUT

10/19/2021
HANDOUT Coleman Atiya 

Part Time Bus 
Driver TRAN-CS-DRPT-NA-27 Transportation 10/20/2021

Part Time Bus Driver to 
replace Marc Pierre 
(hired from P/T to F/T.) 
Appointment and start 
date are contingent upon 
satisfactory completion 
of all new hire 
requirements. 0.5 $25.01/Hr. $25.01/Hr. 

P1A-9
HANDOUT

10/19/2021
HANDOUT Dixon Nicole

Leave Replacement 
Science Teacher-
8th Grade REP-KMS-TCH-SCI-01 KMS

1/3/2022
(or sooner)

Leave Replacement 
Science Teacher-8th 
Grade to replace H. 
West. End date 6/30/22 
and subject to change. 
Ms. Dixon must give 60 
days notice to current 
employer. Will begin 
sooner if possible. 
Non Tenurable. Salary to 
be reflective of the 
UTEA 21-22 rate after 
UTEA agreement 
ratification. Appointment 
and start date are 
contingent upon 
satisfactory completion 
of all new hire 
requirements. III 1 $66,038.00 N/A $66,038.00

P1A-10
HANDOUT

10/19/2021
HANDOUT Lee Ana

Part Time 
Paraprofessional TA-KMS-SSX-NA-41 KMS 10/20/2021

Part Time 
Paraprofessional for 
Special Services for 
budgeted department 
needs. Salary to be 
reflective of the UTEA 
21-22 rate after UTEA 
agreement ratification. 
Appointment and start 
date are contingent upon 
satisfactory completion 
of all new hire 
requirements. 3 1 $21,900.00

$900 
(Credit 
Stipend) $22,800.00

P1A-11
HANDOUT

10/19/2021
HANDOUT Morris Briana Preschool Teacher TCH-CF-TCH-PK-02 CF

1/3/2022
(or sooner)

Preschool Teacher to 
replace D. Pasquale 
(transferred to meet 
district needs). Ms. 
Morris must give 60 
days notice to current 
employer. Will begin 
sooner if possible. Salary 
to be reflective of the 
UTEA 21-22 rate after 
UTEA agreement 
ratification. Appointment 
and start date are 
contingent upon 
satisfactory completion 
of all new hire 
requirements. III 5 1 $67,250.00

$425
(Elem. 
Stipend) $67,675.00
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P1A-12
HANDOUT

10/19/2021
HANDOUT Portes Rosmery Part Time Bus Aide TRAN-CS-ASPT-NA-01 Transportation 10/20/2021

Part Time Bus Aide to 
replace K. Battles 
(Resigned)
Appointment and start 
date are contingent upon 
satisfactory completion 
of all new hire 
requirements. 0.5 $16.27/Hr. $16.27/Hr. 


