

**SOUTH ORANGE DISPOSAL CO.**  
"WE SERVICE NJ'S NEED TO RECYCLE"

SR. SALES EXECUTIVE  
**JOSEPH A. MIELE, JR.**

joemielej@gmail.com

PO Box 179  
185 Church Street  
South Orange, NJ 07079


Office: (973) 762-3880  
Fax: (973) 763-1237  
Cell: (973) 747-2181



**Brian Frohnapfel**  
*Senior Education  
Solutions Representative*

847 Flora Street  
Elizabeth, NJ 07201  
bfrohnap@wm.com

973 477 7870 Cell

 Printed on 100% post-consumer  
recycled paper.

[wm.com](http://wm.com)

2014-2015 BID RESULTS: 1 YEAR PROPOSAL

	A	B	C	D	E	F
		WASTE MGT per yard	S ORANGE DISPOSAL per yard	YARDS	WASTE MGT	S ORANGE DISPOSAL
1						
2	<b>SERVICE &amp; DISPOSAL</b>					
3	<b>SEPTEMBER 1-AUGUST 31</b>					
4	1) UHS	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	2000	\$ 22,520.00	\$ 28,000.00
5	2) BURNET	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	300	\$ 3,378.00	\$ 4,200.00
6	3) WASHINGTON	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	300	\$ 3,378.00	\$ 4,200.00
7	4) FRANKLIN	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	300	\$ 3,378.00	\$ 4,200.00
8	5) BATTLE HILL	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	300	\$ 3,378.00	\$ 4,200.00
9	6) KAVAMEEH	\$ 6.14	\$ 7.00	1500	\$ 9,210.00	\$ 10,500.00
10	7) CONN FARMS	\$ 5.75	\$ 7.00	300	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 2,100.00
11	8) HAMILTON	\$ 5.75	\$ 7.00	300	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 2,100.00
12	9) LIVINGSTON	\$ 5.75	\$ 7.00	300	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 2,100.00
13	10)JEFFERSON	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	300	\$ 3,378.00	\$ 4,200.00
14	11) H CALDWELL	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	300	\$ 3,378.00	\$ 4,200.00
15	12)DISTRICT WIDE	\$ 23.00	\$ 30.00	300	\$ 6,900.00	\$ 9,000.00
16	Alternate 1	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.00	300	\$ 3,378.00	\$ 4,200.00
17						
18	<b>SERVICE &amp; DISPOSAL TOTAL</b>				<b>\$ 67,451.00</b>	<b>\$ 83,200.00</b>
19						
20	<b>RECYCLING</b>			<b>TONS</b>		
21	1) WOOD	\$ 167.00	\$ 120.00	80	\$ 13,360.00	\$ 9,600.00
22	2) METALS	\$ 36.00	no charge	100	\$ 3,600.00	\$ -
23	3) DIRT/ROCK	\$ 78.00	\$ 75.00	50	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 3,750.00
24	4) MIXED OFFICE PAPER	\$ 67.00	no charge	5	\$ 335.00	
25	5) CARDBOARD	\$ 67.00	no charge	5	\$ 335.00	
26						
27				<b>POUNDS</b>		
28	MEDICAL WASTE-per pound	\$ 5.00	NO BID	500	\$ 2,500.00	NO BID
29						
30	Recycling/Medical Waste Total				<b>\$ 24,030.00</b>	<b>\$ 13,350.00</b>
31						
32	<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>				<b>\$ 91,481.00</b>	<b>\$ 96,550.00</b>

2014-2016 BID RESULTS: 2 YEAR PROPOSAL

	A	B	C	D	E	F
		WASTE MGT	S ORANGE DISPOSAL	YARDS	WASTE MGT	S ORANGE DISPOSAL
1						
2	<b>SERVICE &amp; DISPOSAL</b>					
3	<b>SEPTEMBER 1-AUGUST 31</b>					
4	1) UHS	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	2000	\$ 23,200.00	\$ 30,800.00
5	2) BURNET	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,480.00	\$ 4,620.00
6	3) WASHINGTON	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,480.00	\$ 4,620.00
7	4) FRANKLIN	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,480.00	\$ 4,620.00
8	5) BATTLE HILL	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,480.00	\$ 4,620.00
9	6) KAWAMEEH	\$ 6.32	\$ 7.70	1500	\$ 9,480.00	\$ 11,550.00
10	7) CONN FARMS	\$ 5.92	\$ 7.70	300	\$ 1,776.00	\$ 2,310.00
11	8) HAMILTON	\$ 5.92	\$ 7.70	300	\$ 1,776.00	\$ 2,310.00
12	9) LIVINGSTON	\$ 5.92	\$ 7.70	300	\$ 1,776.00	\$ 2,310.00
13	10) JEFFERSON	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,480.00	\$ 4,620.00
14	11) H CALDWELL	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,480.00	\$ 4,620.00
15	12) DISTRICT WIDE	\$ 23.69	\$ 30.00	300	\$ 7,107.00	\$ 9,000.00
16	Alternate 1	\$ 11.60	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,480.00	\$ 4,620.00
17						
18	<b>SERVICE &amp; DISPOSAL TOTAL</b>				<b>\$ 69,475.00</b>	<b>\$ 90,620.00</b>
19						
20	<b>RECYCLING</b>			<b>TONS</b>		
21	1) WOOD	\$ 172.01	\$ 120.00	80	\$ 13,760.80	\$ 9,600.00
22	2) METALS	\$ 37.08	no charge	100	\$ 3,708.00	\$ -
23	3) DIRT/ROCK	\$ 80.34	\$ 75.00	50	\$ 4,017.00	\$ 3,750.00
24	4) MIXED OFFICE PAPER	\$ 69.01	no charge	5	\$ 345.05	\$ -
25	5) CARDBOARD	\$ 69.01	no charge	5	\$ 345.05	\$ -
26						
27				<b>POUNDS</b>		
28	MEDICAL WASTE-per pound	\$ 5.00	<b>NO BID</b>	500	\$ 2,500.00	<b>NO BID</b>
29						
30	Recycling/Medical Waste Total				<b>\$ 24,675.90</b>	<b>\$ 13,350.00</b>
31						
32	<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>				<b>\$ 94,150.90</b>	<b>\$ 103,970.00</b>

2014-2017 BID RESULTS: 3 YEAR PROPOSAL

	A	B	C	D	E	F
		WASTE MGT per yard	S ORANGE DISPOSAL per yard	YARDS	WASTE MGT	S ORANGE DISPOSAL
1	<b>SERVICE &amp; DISPOSAL</b>					
2	<b>SEPTEMBER 1-AUGUST 31</b>					
4	1) UHS	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	2000	\$ 23,900.00	\$ 30,800.00
5	2) BURNET	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,585.00	\$ 4,620.00
6	3) WASHINGTON	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,585.00	\$ 4,620.00
7	4) FRANKLIN	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,585.00	\$ 4,620.00
8	5) BATTLE HILL	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,585.00	\$ 4,620.00
9	6) KAWAMEEH	\$ 6.51	\$ 7.70	1500	\$ 9,765.00	\$ 11,550.00
10	7) CONN FARMS	\$ 6.10	\$ 7.70	300	\$ 1,830.00	\$ 2,310.00
11	8) HAMILTON	\$ 6.10	\$ 7.70	300	\$ 1,830.00	\$ 2,310.00
12	9) LIVINGSTON	\$ 6.10	\$ 7.70	300	\$ 1,830.00	\$ 2,310.00
13	10)JEFFERSON	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,585.00	\$ 4,620.00
14	11) H CALDWELL	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,585.00	\$ 4,620.00
15	12)DISTRICT WIDE	\$ 24.40	\$ 30.00	300	\$ 7,320.00	\$ 9,000.00
16	Alternate 1	\$ 11.95	\$ 15.40	300	\$ 3,585.00	\$ 4,620.00
17						
18	<b>SERVICE &amp; DISPOSAL TOTAL</b>				<b>\$ 71,570.00</b>	<b>\$ 90,620.00</b>
19						
20	<b>RECYCLING</b>			<b>TONS</b>		
21	1) WOOD	\$ 177.17	\$ 120.00	80	\$ 14,173.60	\$ 9,600.00
22	2) METALS	\$ 38.19	<b>no charge</b>	100	\$ 3,819.00	
23	3) DIRT/ROCK	\$ 82.75	\$ 75.00	50	\$ 4,137.50	\$ 3,750.00
24	4) MIXED OFFICE PAPER	\$ 71.08	<b>no charge</b>	5	\$ 355.40	
25	5) CARDBOARD	\$ 71.08	<b>no charge</b>	5	\$ 355.40	
26						
27				<b>POUNDS</b>		
28	MEDICAL WASTE - per pound	\$ 5.25	<b>NO BID</b>	500	\$ 2,625.00	<b>NO BID</b>
29						
30	Recycling/Medical Waste Total				<b>\$ 25,465.90</b>	<b>\$ 13,350.00</b>
31						
32	<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>				<b>\$ 97,035.90</b>	<b>\$ 103,970.00</b>

Waste Mgt.

PROPOSAL FORM - ONE (1) YEAR

TO: UNION TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION  
Administration Building  
2369 Morris Avenue  
Union, NJ 07083

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the specifications entitled "Disposal and Recycling Service", the undersigned proposes to furnish the following services from September 1, 2014 to August 31, 2015 school year at the rates indicated below:

<u>School</u>	<u>Equipment</u>	<u>Sept.-June Pick-up Schedule</u>	<u>Service &amp; Disposal All Inclusive* (Per Yard)</u>
1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. through Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard
2) Burnet	" " "	Mon., Tue, Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard
3) Washington	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard
4) Franklin	" " "	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard
5) Battle Hill	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 6.14/yard
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ 5.75/yard
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Every Tuesday & on Request	\$ 5.75/yard
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ 5.75/yard
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ 23.00/yard
<b>Alternate 1</b>	1 Additional 8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.26/yard

PROPOSAL FORM - ONE (1) YEAR - continued

July and August Pick-Up Schedule

1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ 11.26/yard
2) Burnet	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.26/yard
3) Washington	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.26/yard
4) Franklin	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.26/yard
5) Battle Hill	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.26/yard
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 6.14/yard
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 5.75/yard
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 5.75/yard
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 5.75/yard
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 5.75/yard
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ 11.26/yard
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ 23.00/yard

RECYCLING

	All Inclusive* Per Ton
1. Wood	\$ 167.00/ton
2. Metals (mixed, mostly steel, iron)	\$ 36.00/ton
3. Dirt/Rock	\$ 78.00/ton
4. Mixed Office Paper	\$ 67.00/ton
5. Cardboard	\$ 67.00/ton

MEDICAL WASTE

	All Inclusive* Per Pound
All schools pick up from one central location	\$ 5.00/lb

PROPOSAL FORM – ONE (1) YEAR – continued

\* Price includes all charges whatsoever, including but not limited to taxes, surcharges, tariffs, haulage, disposal or other govt. charges.

The Board reserves the right to award this contract as a whole or by individual school, whichever is in the best interest of the school district.

I hereby certify that all waste collection shall be done in accordance with all Local, County, State and Federal laws.

The Board reserves the right to increase/decrease the number of containers the size of the containers and the frequency of pick-ups at the same prices quoted herein. Price quoted includes all costs including but not limited to all applicable Federal, State and Municipal taxes, container charges, service charges, haulage and disposal of waste.

Signature Donald W. Witt

Company Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.

Address 107 Silvia Street Ewing, NJ 08628

Phone 800-869-5566

Date 8/7/14

PROPOSAL FORM – TWO (2) YEAR

TO: **UNION TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION**  
*Administration Building*  
*2369 Morris Avenue*  
*Union, NJ 07083*

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the specifications entitled "Disposal and Recycling Service", the undersigned proposes to furnish the following services from September 1, 2014 to August 31, 2016 school year at the rates indicated below:

<u>School</u>	<u>Equipment</u>	<u>Sept.-June Pick-up Schedule</u>	<u>Service &amp; Disposal All Inclusive* (Per Yard)</u>
1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. through Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard
2) Burnet	" " "	Mon., Tue, Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard
3) Washington	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard
4) Franklin	" " "	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard
5) Battle Hill	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 6.32/yard
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ 5.92/yard
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Every Tuesday & on Request	\$ 5.92/yard
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ 5.92/yard
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ 23.69/yard
<b>Alternate 1</b>	1 Additional 8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.60/yard



PROPOSAL FORM - TWO (2) YEAR - continued

July and August Pick-Up Schedule

1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>11.60/yard</u>
2) Burnet	" " "	On Request	\$ <u>11.60/yard</u>
3) Washington	" " "	On Request	\$ <u>11.60/yard</u>
4) Franklin	" " "	On Request	\$ <u>11.60/yard</u>
5) Battle Hill	" " "	On Request	\$ <u>11.60/yard</u>
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>6.32/yard</u>
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>5.92/yard</u>
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>5.92/yard</u>
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>5.92/yard</u>
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>5.92/yard</u>
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>11.60/yard</u>
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ <u>23.69/yard</u>

RECYCLING

	<u>All Inclusive*</u> <u>Per Ton</u>
1. Wood	\$ <u>172.01/ton</u>
2. Metals (mixed, mostly steel, iron)	\$ <u>37.08/ton</u>
3. Dirt/Rock	\$ <u>80.34/ton</u>
4. Mixed Office Paper	\$ <u>69.01/ton</u>
5. Cardboard	\$ <u>69.01/ton</u>

MEDICAL WASTE

	<u>All Inclusive*</u> <u>Per Pound</u>
All schools pick up from one central location	\$ <u>5.00/lb</u>

PROPOSAL FORM - TWO (2) YEAR - continued

\* Price includes all charges whatsoever, including but not limited to taxes, surcharges, tariffs, haulage, disposal or other govt. charges.

The Board reserves the right to award this contract as a whole or by individual school, whichever is in the best interest of the school district.

I hereby certify that all waste collection shall be done in accordance with all Local, County, State and Federal laws.

The Board reserves the right to increase/decrease the number of containers the size of the containers and the frequency of pick-ups at the same prices quoted herein. Price quoted includes all costs including but not limited to all applicable Federal, State and Municipal taxes, container charges, service charges, haulage and disposal of waste.

Signature *Ronald West*  
Company Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.  
Address 1074 Silvia Street Ewing, NJ 08628  
Phone 800-869-5566  
Date 8/7/14

PROPOSAL FORM – THREE (3) YEAR

**TO: UNION TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION**  
*Administration Building*  
*2369 Morris Avenue*  
*Union, NJ 07083*

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the specifications entitled "Disposal and Recycling Service", the undersigned proposes to furnish the following services from September 1, 2014 to August 31, 2017 school year at the rates indicated below:

<u>School</u>	<u>Equipment</u>	<u>Sept.-June Pick-up Schedule</u>	<u>Service &amp; Disposal All Inclusive* (Per Yard)</u>
1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. through Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard
2) Burnet	" " "	Mon., Tue, Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard
3) Washington	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard
4) Franklin	" " "	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard
5) Battle Hill	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard
6) Kawameech	3-6 Yd. Open Top	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 6.51/yard
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ 6.10/yard
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Every Tuesday & on Request	\$ 6.10/yard
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ 6.10/yard
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Vert-I Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ 24.40/yard
<b>Alternate 1</b>	1 Additional 8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ 11.95/yard

PROPOSAL FORM - THREE (3) YEAR - continued

July and August Pick-Up Schedule

1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ 11.95/yard
2) Burnet	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.95/yard
3) Washington	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.95/yard
4) Franklin	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.95/yard
5) Battle Hill	" " "	On Request	\$ 11.95/yard
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 6.51/yard
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 6.10/yard
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 6.10/yard
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 6.10/yard
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ 6.10/yard
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ 11.95/yard
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ 24.40/yard

RECYCLING

	All Inclusive* Per Ton
1. Wood	\$ 177.17/ton
2. Metals (mixed, mostly steel, iron)	\$ 38.19/ton
3. Dirt/Rock	\$ 82.75/ton
4. Mixed Office Paper	\$ 71.08/ton
5. Cardboard	\$ 71.08/ton

MEDICAL WASTE

	All Inclusive* Per Pound
All schools pick up from one central location	\$ 5.25/lb

PROPOSAL FORM - THREE (3) YEAR - continued

\* Price includes all charges whatsoever, including but not limited to taxes, surcharges, tariffs, haulage, disposal or other govt. charges.

The Board reserves the right to award this contract as a whole or by individual school, whichever is in the best interest of the school district.

I hereby certify that all waste collection shall be done in accordance with all Local, County, State and Federal laws.

The Board reserves the right to increase/decrease the number of containers the size of the containers and the frequency of pick-ups at the same prices quoted herein. Price quoted includes all costs including but not limited to all applicable Federal, State and Municipal taxes, container charges, service charges, haulage and disposal of waste.

Signature Donald West

Company Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.

Address 107 Silvia Street

Phone Ewing, NJ 08628

Date 8/7/14

PROPOSAL FORM - ONE (1) YEAR

S. Orange Disposal

TO: **UNION TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION**  
**Administration Building**  
**2369 Morris Avenue**  
**Union, NJ 07083**

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the specifications entitled "Disposal and Recycling Service", the undersigned proposes to furnish the following services from September 1, 2014 to August 31, 2015 school year at the rates indicated below:

<u>School</u>	<u>Equipment</u>	<u>Sept.-June Pick-up Schedule</u>	<u>Service &amp; Disposal All Inclusive* (Per Yard)</u>
1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. through Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
2) Burnet	" " "	Mon., Tue, Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
3) Washington	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
4) Franklin	" " "	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
5) Battle Hill	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Every Tuesday & on Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ <u>30.00</u>
<b>Alternate 1</b>	1 Additional 8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>

**PROPOSAL FORM – ONE (1) YEAR - continued**

**July and August Pick-Up Schedule**

1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
2) Burnet	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
3) Washington	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
4) Franklin	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
5) Battle Hill	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.00</u>
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>14.00</u>
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ <u>30.00</u>

**RECYCLING**

	All Inclusive* Per Ton
1. Wood	\$ <u>120.00</u>
2. Metals (mixed, mostly steel, iron)	\$ <u>No Charge</u>
3. Dirt/Rock	\$ <u>75.00</u>
4. Mixed Office Paper	\$ <u>No Charge</u>
5. Cardboard	\$ <u>No Charge</u>

**MEDICAL WASTE**

	All Inclusive* Per Pound
All schools pick up from one central location	\$ <u>No Bid (N/A)</u>

PROPOSAL FORM -- ONE (1) YEAR -- continued

\* Price includes all charges whatsoever, including but not limited to taxes, surcharges, tariffs, haulage, disposal or other govt. charges.

The Board reserves the right to award this contract as a whole or by individual school, whichever is in the best interest of the school district.

I hereby certify that all waste collection shall be done in accordance with all Local, County, State and Federal laws.

The Board reserves the right to increase/decrease the number of containers the size of the containers and the frequency of pick-ups at the same prices quoted herein. Price quoted includes all costs including but not limited to all applicable Federal, State and Municipal taxes, container charges, service charges, haulage and disposal of waste.

Signature *Robert M. J.*  
Company South Orange Disposal Co.  
Address PO Box 179/185 Church St. South Orange, NJ 07079  
Phone (973) 762-3880  
Date 8/6/14



PROPOSAL FORM – TWO (2) YEAR

**TO: UNION TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION**  
**Administration Building**  
**2369 Morris Avenue**  
**Union, NJ 07083**

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the specifications entitled "Disposal and Recycling Service", the undersigned proposes to furnish the following services from September 1, 2014 to August 31, 2016 school year at the rates indicated below:

<u>School</u>	<u>Equipment</u>	<u>Sept.-June Pick-up Schedule</u>	<u>Service &amp; Disposal All Inclusive* (Per Yard)</u>
1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. through Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
2) Burnet	" " "	Mon., Tue, Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
3) Washington	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
4) Franklin	" " "	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
5) Battle Hill	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Every Tuesday & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ <u>30.00</u>
<b>Alternate 1</b>	1 Additional 8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>

PROPOSAL FORM – TWO (2) YEAR - continued

July and August Pick-Up Schedule

1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
2) Burnet	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
3) Washington	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
4) Franklin	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
5) Battle Hill	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ <u>30.00</u>

RECYCLING

	<u>All Inclusive*</u> <u>Per Ton</u>
1. Wood	\$ <u>120.00</u>
2. Metals (mixed, mostly steel, iron)	\$ <u>No Charge</u>
3. Dirt/Rock	\$ <u>75.00</u>
4. Mixed Office Paper	\$ <u>No Charge</u>
5. Cardboard	\$ <u>No Charge</u>

MEDICAL WASTE

All Inclusive\*  
Per Pound

All schools pick up from one central location

\$ No Bid (N/A)

**PROPOSAL FORM – TWO (2) YEAR – continued**

\* Price includes all charges whatsoever, including but not limited to taxes, surcharges, tariffs, haulage, disposal or other govt. charges.

The Board reserves the right to award this contract as a whole or by individual school, whichever is in the best interest of the school district.

I hereby certify that all waste collection shall be done in accordance with all Local, County, State and Federal laws.

The Board reserves the right to increase/decrease the number of containers the size of the containers and the frequency of pick-ups at the same prices quoted herein. Price quoted includes all costs including but not limited to all applicable Federal, State and Municipal taxes, container charges, service charges, haulage and disposal of waste.

Signature Robert Muly  
Company South Orange Disposal Co.  
Address P.O. Box 179/185 Church St. South Orange, NJ 07079  
Phone (973) 762-3880  
Date 8/6/14

PROPOSAL FORM - THREE (3) YEAR

**TO: UNION TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION**  
**Administration Building**  
**2369 Morris Avenue**  
**Union, NJ 07083**

Gentlemen:

Having carefully examined the specifications entitled "Disposal and Recycling Service", the undersigned proposes to furnish the following services from September 1, 2014 to August 31, 2017 school year at the rates indicated below:

<u>School</u>	<u>Equipment</u>	<u>Sept.-June Pick-up Schedule</u>	<u>Service &amp; Disposal All Inclusive* (Per Yard)</u>
1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. through Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
2) Burnet	" " "	Mon., Tue, Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
3) Washington	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
4) Franklin	" " "	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
5) Battle Hill	" " "	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed., Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Every Tuesday & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	Mon., Wed, Fri. & on Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Vert-I Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ <u>30.00</u>
<b>Alternate 1</b>	1 Additional 8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	Mon. and Thurs. & on Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>

**PROPOSAL FORM – THREE (3) YEAR - continued**

**July and August Pick-Up Schedule**

1) UHS	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
2) Burnet	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
3) Washington	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
4) Franklin	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
5) Battle Hill	“ “ “	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
6) Kawameeh	3-6 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
7) Conn. Farms	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
8) Hamilton	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
9) Livingston	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
10) Jefferson	1-8 Yd. Open Top	On Request	\$ <u>7.70</u>
11) H. Caldwell	8 Yd. Vert-I-Pack	On Request	\$ <u>15.40</u>
12) District Wide	30 Yd Container	On Request	\$ <u>30.00</u>

**RECYCLING**

	<u>All Inclusive*</u> <u>Per Ton</u>
1. Wood	\$ <u>120.00</u>
2. Metals (mixed, mostly steel, iron)	\$ <u>No Charge</u>
3. Dirt/Rock	\$ <u>75.00</u>
4. Mixed Office Paper	\$ <u>No Charge</u>
5. Cardboard	\$ <u>No Charge</u>

**MEDICAL WASTE**

	<u>All Inclusive*</u> <u>Per Pound</u>
All schools pick up from one central location	\$ <u>No Bid (N/A)</u>

**PROPOSAL FORM – THREE (3) YEAR – continued**

\* Price includes all charges whatsoever, including but not limited to taxes, surcharges, tariffs, haulage, disposal or other govt. charges.

The Board reserves the right to award this contract as a whole or by individual school, whichever is in the best interest of the school district.

I hereby certify that all waste collection shall be done in accordance with all Local, County, State and Federal laws.

The Board reserves the right to increase/decrease the number of containers the size of the containers and the frequency of pick-ups at the same prices quoted herein. Price quoted includes all costs including but not limited to all applicable Federal, State and Municipal taxes, container charges, service charges, haulage and disposal of waste.

Signature *Robert M. [unclear]*  
Company South Orange Disposal Co.  
Address PO Box 179/185 Church St. South Orange, NJ 07079  
Phone (973) 762-3880  
Date 8/6/14